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1000LB Motorcycle lift 
(Hydraulic) 
Instruction manual

Important: 
Please read this instruction manual carefully. Note the safety 
instructions and warnings. Use the product correctly and 
with care for the purpose for which it is intended.

Parameter: 
Capacity: 1000 LBS 
min height: 180 MM 
max height: 780 MM

Features

1. Air or Hydraulic Powered Mechanism

2. �Removable plate for increased access, such as rear wheel 
removal

3. Adjustable foot for increased safety and stability

4. �Safety set increases safety against accidental descent of 
table

Operation

1. �Ensure that the table is at the minimum height, and that 
the ramp is in place.

2. �Lock off the release valve, steadily pump the foot pedal 
until the table reaches a required height, or using the air 
pump to lifting the motorcycle lift. Connect the hose to the 
air feeder directly before operate the air pump, then press 
valve to rise the table, and loosen the valve to stop.

3. �Lock the safety set at the required height. Then repair the 
motorcycle.

4. After repairing, remove the safety set.

5. Steadily pump the foot pedal, Let the table lower

6. �Remove the motorcycle from its stand and wheel it off the 
back of the table via the ramp.

Maintenance

1. �The mechanical parts of the lift, such as the foot pedal 
and release shafts should be occasionally lubricated with 
heavy oil or grease.

2. �Protect the lift cylinder from dirt or dust. If it becomes 
dirty, wipe it off with a clean cloth.

3. �Maintain and store the lift in a reasonably protected 
environment. Do not expose to rain or excess moisture. 
Protect from salt water or other corrosive materials.

Warning

1. Always check the lift before use.

2. �Do not operate under the table, keeping hands and body 
away from the table when it‘s operating. The air hose 
should be pulled from bottom, not on the table.

3. �When lowing the table, take care to control the speed of 
descent.

4. �When the table is at its highest elevated position, do not 
attempt to pump the table higher as this can damage the 
mechanism.
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